
Agenda Item 19 Appendix 1 
 

Stronger Communities Partnership Prioritisation of Community 
Engagement Framework Actions  
 
PRIORITY Area 1 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
PRIORITY Area 2 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
PRIORITY Area 3 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Develop a partnership funding 
strategy that recognises the 
role of community and 
voluntary sector in enabling 
engagement (relates to 
Stronger Communities 
Review and long term funding 
for CD and SCP)       NI 4/7 

 
Development of a 
Communications Plan for the 
SCP and CEF 
 
 

                                         NI 4 

NEW! 

Skills Audit of SC Partnership 
- skills of members of 

SCP 
- what engagement are 

SC partners doing? 

 
Communications Task Group 
established  

                                         NI 4 

 
Develop Community Workers 
Network to share information 
and learning 
 
 

NI 4 
 

 
Training and development 
programme – ongoing 
development 
 

                                   NI 4/6/7 

 
 
Build better understanding 
about representation 
 
 

NI 4/6/7 

NEW! 
 
Get Involved! campaign – exit 
strategy 
 
 

                                   NI 4/6/7 

 
 
Community Buildings Task 
Group established 
 

 

                                      NI 6/7 

 
Community Engagement 
champions identified within 
BHCC (& other public sector) 
 
 

NI 4/7 

 
Support awareness raising 
within public bodies around 
equalities issues 
 
 

NI 4 

 
Asset Transfer Strategy – 
strategy development for 
management of assets inc. 
transfer 
 

NI 6/7 
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PRIORITY Area 4 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

NB – There are 29 actions in the Framework, but some have been grouped where they 
addressed related themes 

 

 
Common policy for supporting 
community representatives 
working collaboratively with 
service providers 
 

NI 4/6/7 
 

Develop a policy on how 

services will be coordinated 

within neighbourhoods – NOT 

SC Partnership led 

NI 4/7 

 
Recognise and resource new 
or alternative engagement 
approaches and support 
representation of new 
communities 

NI 4/6/7 
 

 
Promotion of the Community 
Mark 
 

Establish review and 
evaluation process that all 
partners are signed up to that 
allows all partners to learn 
from good practice 
 

NI 4 
 

Searchable database of 
consultations (Consultation 
portal is live but promotion, 
training and development 
needed to ensure it is used 
effectively) 

NI 4 
 

 
Explore potential for 
communications hub for 
public bodies through which 
they coordinate 
communication with residents 
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